

Response to: FOI_22-23_098 September 2022

Temporary Accommodation

1. From 23 March 2020 how many individuals have been placed in temporary accommodation/hotel or B&B accommodation outside of the constituency they were registered with NIHE at.

The Housing Executive does not record this data. The Housing Executive does not record placements made by temporary accommodation location as an identifier on the Housing Management System. All placements are identified by the Housing Solutions team from which the placement is made.

2. From 23 March 2020 the amount paid to each establishment for hosting those from without the constituency broken down by establishment - hotel/temp accommodation or bed and breakfast.

Please see the response to Q.1. The Housing Executive does not record this data.

3. From 23 March 2020 broken down by constituency, the cost of taxis or other travel when relocating individuals from one area to another.

Please see the answer to Q.1. The Housing Executive does not record this data.