STRATEGIC HOUSING AUTHORITY

[ )
Housing
2 Adelaide Street, Belfast BT2 8PB
ExeCUtlve 03448 920 900

nihe.gov.uk

25 June 2025

Dear Applicant

Our Ref: FOI 784

Your request for information received on 28 May 2025 has been handled under the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

Request

Please provide the following information in relation to the Dungannon area (BT70 and
BT71 postcodes) for the period between 1 April 2024 and 1 April 2025:

1. How many properties were allocated by the Northern Ireland Housing Executive
to tenants in this area during the specified time frame?

2. Of these allocations, how many were made to tenants who identify as British,
Northern Irish, or Irish?

3. How many of these properties were allocated to tenants who identify as neither
British, Northern Irish, nor Irish?

4. How many of the properties were allocated to individuals who are not UK or Irish
citizens?

Our response

As advised in our email of 28" May, the Housing Executive does not record the requested
information by postcode district so the response has been provided by the revised
geographies you accepted, NIHE Dungannon Office Area and NIHE Common Landlord
Area. The information provided must be read in conjunction with the accompanying notes.

Table 1 below provides data on the number of housing allocations from 01/04/2024 to
31/03/2025 to applicants on the Social Housing Waiting List in the Dungannon NIHE Local
Office area by nationality:



Table 1: Allocations from 01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 to applicants on the
Social Housing Waiting List in Dungannon NIHE Local Office by Nationality
British/Irish/Northern Irish 95
Dungannon NIHE Local Other, incl. Mixed 57
Office Unknown 6
Dungannon Local Office
158
Total
British/Irish/Northern Irish 5195
Other, incl. Mixed 451
N. Ireland Total Refused 6
Unknown 402
N. Ireland Total 6054

Table 2 below provides the same data on the number of housing allocations from
01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 to applicants on the Social Housing Waiting List in the
Dungannon NIHE Local Office area by nationality, broken down by Common Landlord
Area (CLA):

Table 2: Allocations from 01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 to applicants on the Social
Housing Waiting List in Dungannon NIHE Local Office by Nationality & Common
Landlord Area (CLA)
. NIHE Common

NII;H(E;LocaI Office Landlord Area (CLA) Nationality (Grouped) No. (.)f

eography / Geo h allocations
grapny
Ackinduff CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Aughnacloy CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Ballygawley CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Bush CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Cappagh CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Castlecaulfield CLA Other, incl. Mixed <10
Castlecaulfield CLA Total <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Church Street CLA Other, incl. Mixed <10
Church Street CLA Total <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Dungannon NIHE | Clogher CLA Other, incl. Mixed <10
Local Office Clogher CLA Total <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish 11
Coalisland CLA Other, incl. Mixed 13
Unknown <10
Coalisland CLA Total -
British/Irish/Northern Irish 38
Other, incl. Mixed 27
Dungannon CLA Unknown <10
Dungannon CLA Total -
Other, incl. Mixed <10
Dungannon Town Unknown <10
Centre CLA

Dungannon TC CLA Total <10
Fivemiletown CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10




Table 2: Allocations from 01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 to applicants on the Social
Housing Waiting List in Dungannon NIHE Local Office by Nationality & Common
Landlord Area (CLA)
. NIHE Common
NII}H(ESLocaI Office Landlord Area (CLA) Nationality (Grouped) No. (.)f
eography / Geo h allocations
grapny

Gortmerron CLA Other, incl. Mixed <10
Laghey CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish 12
Milltown Dugannon Other, incl. Mixed <10
CLA Milltown Dugannon CLA i

Total
British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Other, incl. Mixed <10
Moy CLA Unknown <10
Moy CLA Total <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
Moygashel CLA Other, incl. Mixed <10
Moygashel CLA Total <10
Newmills CLA British/Irish/Northern Irish <10
British/Irish/Northern Irish 5195
Other, incl. Mixed 451
N. Ireland Total N. Ireland Total Refused 6
Unknown 402
N. Ireland Total 6054

Notes:

This response is based on the most recently published data (allocations up to
31/03/2025).

Allocations are aggregated over a 1-year period from 01/04/2024 to 31/03/2025 and
include allocations to both Housing Executive and housing association properties.

Nationality figures are based on the recorded nationality of the main applicant (as
recorded on the Housing Management System). Other nationalities are nationalities
other than British, Irish and Northern Irish.

Please note that information in this response has been anonymised in line with UK
GDPR and ICO and NISRA guidance. <10 are cases where numbers are less than
10.

The Housing Executive does not record the citizenship status of applicants so cannot
provide the information you have requested in point 4 of your request.

This concludes our response.





