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We received your request on 31 January 2025 for the following information:

Under the Freedom of Information Act | request

1. The amount of funding Radius Housing Association has received over the last three

years

2. How they have accounted with the Executive the extra spend on illegal activities
such as removing tenants from their properties, (I am aware that | am not the only one)
3. How NIHE are going to address this matter
4. How much the housing associations receive when they take in a new tenant.

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

Our response

1. Please see the table below for the funding provided to Radius Housing Association
over the last three financial years:

2021/22 2022/23 2023/24 Total
£k's £k's £k's £k's
Funding to Radius Housing
Association by NIHE 25,953 35,706 29,080 [ 90,739

2. The Northern Ireland Housing Executive does not hold this information.

3. Housing Associations are regulated by the Department for Communities, hence it is

not within the remit of NIHE to respond to, investigate or address such concerns.
4. The Northern Ireland Housing Executive does not hold this information.

This concludes our response.



